

DOUGLAS COUNTY SCHOOL SYSTEM
 ITB 18-018
 VIDEO INSIGHT CAMERA FOR LITHIA SPRINGS HIGH SCHOOL
 BID TABULATION SHEET
 7/7/17

QTY	PART NUMBER	DESCRIPTION	Perimutter Purchasing Power		B&H Photo		A3 Communications		NetPlanner Systems		Miller Electric Company	
			UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST
1	NVR-R-2-2-36TB	Video Insight Network Video Recorder	\$9,366.00	\$9,366.00	No Bid		\$7,619.38	\$7,619.38	\$10,782.48	\$10,782.48	\$10,932.35	\$10,932.35
10	B-5360	Video Insight Panoramic IP Camera	\$451.00	\$4,510.00	No Bid		\$342.85	\$3,428.50	\$528.39	\$5,283.90	\$535.29	\$5,352.90
5	WV-SFV481	Panasonic Panoramic Outdoor Camera	\$1,321.00	\$6,605.00	\$1,394.00	\$6,970.00	\$1,282.23	\$6,411.15	\$1,561.04	\$7,805.20	\$1,576.47	\$7,882.35
3	PWM485S	Outdoor Wall Mount Kit	\$75.00	\$225.00	\$87.00	\$261.00	\$72.79	\$218.37	\$89.28	\$267.84	\$92.21	\$276.63
2	A-44-OD-MB	Dome Camera Wall Mount	\$48.00	\$96.00	No Bid		\$37.88	\$75.76	\$56.10	\$112.20	\$56.82	\$113.64
2	A-54-V2	Dome Camera	\$583.00	\$1,166.00	No Bid		\$461.16	\$922.32	\$682.81	\$1,365.62	\$671.76	\$1,343.52
2	PCM485S	Corner Mount Kit	\$158.00	\$316.00	\$170.00	\$340.00	\$153.48	\$306.96	\$186.99	\$373.98	\$203.53	\$407.06
4	VP-16-V2	16 Channel Freestanding HDTV Video Encoder 30 FPS, H.264, 4-channel audio input (Encoder is ONVIF Compliant) 3 year advanced replacement warranty includes Video Insight VMS Software for all channels with unlimited SUP (software upgrade program) for all updates and major software releases	\$1,038.00	\$4,152.00	No Bid		\$820.77	\$3,283.08	\$1,214.81	\$4,859.24	\$1,231.18	\$4,924.72
Estimated Delivery Time After Receipt of Order			30 Days		7-14 Business Days ARO		5-7 Business Days		2 Weeks		3 Weeks	
GRAND TOTAL:			\$26,436.00		\$7,571.00		\$22,265.52		\$30,850.46		\$31,233.17	

APPARENT LOW BIDDER: A-3 Communications

Jana Flanigan
 DCSD Representative

7/7/2017
 Date


 DCSD Representative

7/10/17
 Date